Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KL/TV (N)/634/2021-2023

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2021

CHOE NMQ

KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWImeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW1SI018H00®] (nIM1RVe]S)EmMOY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

@1 QUMD a0, 2021 26681 03
analie 10 ) 03rd July 2021
y IJ;( 1196 2illnymo 19 “"L’,J;? 1950
ol. Thiruvananthapuram, 19th Mithunam 1196
Saturday 1943 @GR HUOIWIo 12
12th Ashadha 1943
GHh 03 MAINID
oo (Pl dldmoem-adl) Aldsa]
aile2emoalmo
M@ 7733/68105.M512/2020/0@a0. @logaimamale, 2021 8yoee: 2

1196 olnymo 18
1943 @ratou9o 11.

2021 myeeel 1-00 DRG] 66:08 NAIBEMNA Qll8oeNI06)0 ]SO @IS alO@YIM

&3SIMMMY e lomERMEBRE81Ss @RAlAIlERISID] DGIMI@ (@ IMSIRLEN|SICmIIM].

WNAIBERNIOS 2OMOQIMB (018000,

aLoglal ag)o. Od.,
Mo ta¥(©@3 TV 501 (Nl@m0).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




2021-9e1 84-20 MNIA 6323

2021-9£1 6HO8 Hal0}dls 6MIFo dO®ISIENS] chuamIwl
(ceaum]) aadaulmamdm’

R0® OlojeRfleslend  ag)$lalOloensde  TVOAICNVOODI@  BHO8  VAUBGRNA

aflgoenioee SO ©).

2008-6)£1 BHHOB 6210}B5lS BMIF0 OMO¥IRINE] UMW @DEY

6RAVDI 2IgRMBIMI8s
&0}
a303lonad

aflole,.—2020-0e1 6508 6210}&ls 650 6®I¥IeNg] eeuamlul (6RRUGI)

edlmmmy  (2020-ee1  42) 2020 =yooel  29-00 @G  6HO8  NAIRENA
aflgoenioeq]sioml@lo}malmoelo;

2020 @MY 24-00 @IV G2UBM  GHOS TVOMLNIM  MIVATVEWOS
MLEMSNOMI@  (EINS®M® BAWIMNMAVIAT) aldh0o MVoNIM MIWATVEIAS G0}
@B ©30NUOM@IM88 &0} mild MleamEXI® @GPl lesnmalmgo
aIOQRIBNMMIMYo Bl @IMoeIo;

EINV@® adclmadmileel aljaInunsud Mleimldomimm@lmoil 2020-0e1 6,08
8210)@ls 6350 OMISIeNg] eauamlull (6e3L®I) sodlmmmy (2020-ee1 60) 2020
&M igoeni@ 26-00 MM 608 VAIBEMA Aill8oenine ]S}l @IMIel}o;

2020 allavoenid 31-00 DI G2IBM GHOS ALOMLNIM MIVWAMVEWIHS
memsmomlee 2021 28mMaldl 8-00 D®I @YOoEls] 2021 22m3Idl 22-00 IO
@OAIMVOM2|ORAOW EHOS MVMNIM MIVANVE@OS MVEIMASNODIL0 (@ISO
&03UIMMilmMiald:0o MeMNIM MIATVE@IAS B0} @YBQ BBIENBNUVMM BIMSS
630} enil@d mlameIcd @AMl flesymalmyo aIOOBNM@IMYo
&lomloymmlmoelo;

@INV@® adalmadmileel aljainunseud Mleimldomim@lmoil 2021-6e1 66,08
8210)83ls 6350 OMISIeNs] ea:uamIuwl (6B sddullmmay (2021-ee1 12) 2021
©anENRAIG] 9-0o MG B8 VAUBHNE Qllgoenioee]s;OmIAoM @IMoeRo;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




2021 2@ 24-00 GIO® @YOoEls] 2021 23363 10-00 BN @OQITVIM],] 608
MVOMNOM  MIWAMVEWIDS  TVEIASMEILIOD  (EITVO®  603WIMMSIMald00
MoMNIM MIWAMVEWHS &0} CBBY  OGIENUOMDINMS8 8303  enilad
W@aMEDI@ ERAIMGlQ{leemM@IMie aldqOBHMTIMIe dSl@OMIyM@IMmoeRo;

ROOMOMING BOEMALISM@OS 213-00 BRM}B5JRo (2)-00 6U6MWo (ag)) Daleemb
@100  EINVO®  &dWlmadavlay 2021  e339eel  5-00 @@ (@loenielfo
D00 @IMIL0;

@®  adallmmdadleel  arINGud  MleImBemOdIClealm  aldtHo
©OUHAEERUB DENBIGIOHAM GIMILI0;

608 MLOMNIM MIWANVE TVEMASMOBILIEOCDIMOLIo @IM VMO MSals]
af)SIBHNEMRM GYQUUDINIBIIN TVOaN2I0IEBRUY MlelnlleeemEm 6308 VAIBNABHS)
@6NIRLIMODIBlBNM BIMOLI0;

DG |0Ud, @P@IMI@, BIOOOTIONG BOEMALISM@IES 213-0, @PMBaIG0 (1)-00
QUMD EIHO00  M@MHea]s  G@oWle00630d  allmle@ouils), 608  !aIdeRd
@969 |0 SAAWIMMY Qil80enIne)e |SIoYmIIMi—

1. 21)0)89B |00 (@1000EAIe.—(1) M aodalmadavlal 2021-681 6H08 6.2103d5lS
e™IS0 6®2¥1e108] eaHamilull (6eRLWMI) 830BAIMMMY ag)MY Gald alO@o.

(2) @ 2020 =yeoel 300, OO (@EPMIEKO®I@ UM
B 0YO6)|ESEIBMIE).

2.2008-0£1 17-00 BR)BQ ®OL6IENBHM0D] 6EENDI 6)21QY6)a |ESENEGIEN).—EDD
a03ulmaday mlelailelldlesym &oe1o) 2008-01 8508 §2103&]S M50 OISR
UMWl @BGIM  (2008-0e1 17) (DGIMIBUDHo  (©IWIM  BBBY  ag)TNIET
a1000AUTlE6)6)0|S1H) 3-00 QI QIO D]BlENM  BERENDIB:UdB6)
aillew@ao@] (106nIelEMmENEIIBleaymM @Ie).

3. 5-00 QI)q {1603 GEREROM].—(@IWIM BYB:QIOLI 5-00 Qlds)a f|@d,—

(1) (1)-00 9alQiBafl@d “MQl DO} OJal” o) QUOLEEUDBE) ald:@o “Mig

2)6eMal® 0ol ag)0M QAUIBNGUD GalBCHENZMIG);

(ii) (2)-00 DalQIBY{l@d “MG] DOYIT) OJat” o)A AUIBNGUBBE) ald@o “MYg

2)6eMal® 0ol ag)M QDB UD CalBEHASENITIIG;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




(iii) (3)-00 2alQId)ofl@d “oyMIQl MO @} ©Jal” o) QIIBIBUDHE)

ald0o “mM gl @ROI® 0ol af)aM QAUILOIGUD B2lGBLEENB®IGN).

4. 0G089E0 &9l0NEeeR—(1) 2021-081 6HO8 ©210)BlS EMISe H®IYIRINS]

eaHnMIWl (6cEVDI) s0dWlMmMM (2021-ee1 12) @M@ 0308l lolesymm;.

(2) ®REROM 0308IVIOMOITBOMEM @Yo, (EIMIT® BIBUIMABMY (18000
6RRLM  ©alQea]s  @IWIM  AGHIMBISIB  OUDDEMO D@
SHO}MS)MEMO @O  oBOO®IEo  &HOOBEAD  a)SIOMEMI  af)SION@ID]
BS0}0S}MEMI BPYW aBO@BEIER0 MSalSIEWI, 0D BOBWIMMMY (@18:000 CGRRUM)I
0219003 (@IWOm @BGladsl$l@d 621D @ICI 2)S) O ICI
B 0}ME]ESEIBMOIEI.

@0lal Ma0MNE 61000,
DQICPE.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Law (Legislation-C) Department

NOTIFICATION

No.7733/Leg. C2/2020/Law. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 2nd July, 2021

18th Mithunam,1196
11th Ashadha, 1943.

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of
Kerala is pleased to authorise the publication in the Gazette of the following translation in
English language of the Kerala Small Plantation Workers’ Welfare Fund (Amendment)
Ordinance, 2021 (84 of 2021).

By order of the Governor,

SADIQUE M. K.,
Special Secretary (Law).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




[Translation in English of “2021-6£1 6808 ©.210}&5ls 6®250 OS] @MWl
(eeeL®]) 6303aImadaS” published under the authority of the Governor.]

ORDINANCE No. 84 OF 2021

THE KERALA SMALL PLANTATION WORKERS” WELFARE FUND
(AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2021

Promulgated by the Governor of Kerala in the Seventy-second Year of the Republic of
India.

AN

ORDINANCE

to amend the Kerala Small Plantation Workers® Welfare Fund Act, 2008.

Preamble.—WHEREAS, the Kerala Small Plantation Workers” Welfare Fund
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (42 of 2020) was promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on
the 29th day of July, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala
during its session convened on the 24th day of August, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, in order to keep alive the provisions of the said Ordinance, the Kerala
Small Plantation Workers” Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (60 of 2020) was
promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on the 26th day of September, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala,
during its session which convened on the 31st day of December, 2020 and during its session
which commenced on the 8th day of January, 2021 and ended on the 22nd day of
January, 2021;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




AND WHEREAS, in order to keep alive the provisions of the said Ordinance, the Kerala
Small Plantation Workers’ Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 (12 of 2021) was
promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on the 9th day of February, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala,
during its session which commenced on the 24th day of May, 2021 and ended on the 10th
day of June, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, under sub-clause (a) of clause (2) of Article 213 of the Constitution of

India, the said Ordinance will cease to operate on the 5th day of July, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, difficulties will arise if the provisions of the said Ordinance are not kept

alive;

AND WHEREAS, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala is not in session, and the
Governor of Kerala is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to

take immediate action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article 213 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor of Kerala is pleased to promulgate the following

Ordinance:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Ordinance may be called the the Kerala

Small Plantation Workers” Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2021.
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 30th day of July, 2020.

2. Act 17 of 2008 to be temporarily amended.—During the period of operation of this
Ordinance, the Kerala Small Plantation Workers’ Welfare Fund Act, 2008 (17 of 2008)
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act) shall have effect subject to the amendments

specified in section 3.
3. Amendment of section 5.—In the principal Act, in section 5,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “one hundred and twenty rupees”, the words “one

hundred and eighty rupees” shall be substituted;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




(i1) 1in sub-section (2), for the words “one hundred and twenty rupees”, the words

“one hundred and eighty rupees” shall be substituted,

(iil) in sub-section (3), for the words “two hundred and forty rupees”, the words

“three hundred and sixty rupees” shall be substituted.

4. Repeal and saving.—(1) The Kerala Small Plantation Workers’ Welfare Fund
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 ( 12 of 2021) is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or deemed to have been done or any
action taken or deemed to have been taken under the principal Act as amended by the said
Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the principal Act, as amended by

this Ordinance.

ARIF MOHAMMED KHAN,
GOVERNOR.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES
AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 202%sg: .

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/

Digitally signed by Salim A
Date:2021.07.03 04:08:08 +05:30




		2021-07-03T16:08:08+0530
	Salim A




